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AGENDA 
EXECUTIVE COMMITTEE 
 Monday, October 28, 2019 

5:00 p.m. 
Hilton Head Island Branch Library,  

11 Beach City Road, Hilton Head Island, SC  
 

 Committee Members:   
        Stu Rodman, Chairman    
        Brian Flewelling, Vice Chairman    
        Alice Howard         
        Lawrence McElynn    
        Joseph Passiment 

Paul Sommerville                      

 
1. CALL TO ORDER – 5:00 p.m.  
 
2. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

 
[Public notification of this meeting has been published, posted, and distributed in compliance 
with the South Carolina Freedom of Information Act]   

 
3. APPROVAL OF AGENDA 
 
4. APPROVAL OF MINUTES  (backup) 

A. October 14, 2019  
 

5. EXECUTIVE SESSION 
A. Discussion of proposed purchase of property and issues incident thereto (Harris Pillow-

Fee Simple)  - Barbara Holmes, RCLPP Contractor  
B. Discussion of proposed purchase of property and issues incident thereto (the Lobeco 

Property) – Eric Greenway, Community Development Director 
C. Receipt of legal advice regarding delinquent stormwater fees – Brittany Ward, Deputy 

County Attorney  
D. Receipt of legal advice regarding status of Retiree Litigation  - Thomas J. Keaveny II, 

Beaufort County Attorney and Al Nickles, Nickles Law Firm 
 
6. MATTERS ARISING OUT OF EXECUTIVE SESSION 

 



Agenda – Executive Committee                     
October 28, 2019 
Page 2 of 2 
 

                                                                   

7. ACTION ITEMS 
A. Contract Award Recommendation to JS Construction of Okatie, SC. for the  Hilton 

Head Island Airport Campus Entrance Improvement Project in the amount of 
281,783.00 - Jon Rembold, Airports Director (backup) 

 
8. DISCUSSION 

A. Millage change - Jim Beckert, Auditor Beaufort County 
(backup) 
 

9. CITIZEN COMMENTS (Comments regarding agenda items only and limited to 3 
minutes.) 

 
10. ADJOURNMENT  
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BEAUFORT COUNTY COUNCIL 

Agenda Item Summary 

Item Title: 

Council Committee: 

Meeting Date: 

 
Committee Presenter (Name and Title): 

 
Issues for Consideration: 

 
Points to Consider: 

 
Funding & Liability Factors: 

 
Council Options: 

 
Recommendation: 

Approval of Minutes from October 14, 2019

Executive Committee

October 28, 2019

Approve October 14, 2018 draft minutes

None.

Approve, Modify or Reject

Approve



 

MINUTES 
EXECUTIVE COMMITTEE 

 
 October 14, 2019 
 

 Executive Conference Room, Administration Building,  
Beaufort County Government Robert Smalls Complex,  

100 Ribaut Road, Beaufort, South Carolina 29902 
  

The electronic and print media duly notified in 
accordance with the State Freedom of Information Act. 

 
ATTENDANCE 
 

Present: Committee Chairman Stu Rodman, Committee Vice Chairman Brian Flewelling, 
Paul Sommerville, Alice Howard, and Lawrence McElynn,  

Absent: Joseph Passiment 

Ex-officio: Chris Hervochon, York Glover, Michael Covert, and Gerald Dawson (Non-
committee members of Council serve as ex-officio members and are entitled to 
vote.) 

Staff: 
 
 
 
Media: 

Thomas J. Keaveny II, County Attorney; Ashley Jacobs, County Administrator; 
Brittany Ward, Deputy Attorney; Chris Inglese, Deputy Attorney; Stefanie 
Nagid, Passive Parks Manager.  
 
Joe Croley, Lowcountry Inside Track  

 
CALL TO ORDER 

 
Councilman Rodman called the meeting to order at 3:59 p.m. 
 
Public notification of this meeting has been published, posted, and distributed in compliance 
with the South Carolina Freedom of Information Act 
 
APPROVAL OF AGENDA 
 
Motion: It was moved by Councilman Flewelling, seconded by Councilwoman Howard to approve 
the agenda as presented. The vote: YAYS – Councilman Rodman, Councilman Sommerville, 
Councilman Hervochon, Councilman Glover, Councilman McElynn, Councilman Covert, Councilman 
Dawson, Councilman Flewelling and Councilman Lawson.  The motion passed. 
 
APPROVAL OF MINUTES 
 
A. June 10, 2019 
B. June 17, 2019 
C. August 12, 2019 
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Motion: It was moved by Councilman Flewelling, seconded by Councilwoman Howard to approve 
the minutes. The vote: YAYS – Councilman Rodman, Councilman Sommerville, Councilman 
Hervochon, Councilman Glover, Councilman McElynn, Councilman Covert, Councilman Dawson, 
Councilman Flewelling and Councilman Lawson.  The motion passed. 
 
CITIZEN COMMENTS 
 
Skip Hoglan spoke regarding A tax funds, item number 2 on the agenda. Mr. Hoglan stated that the a-
tax committee should decide how much each organization gets. Period. By voting to allow one non-
profit over others to get extra tax money opens a Pandora’s box of accusations that this one non-profit 
is getting special treatment outside of the County Ordinance. These non-profits aren’t even providing 
all of the receipts for the money they receive. They shouldn’t get one penny more until they are totally 
compliant with the law, totally transparent, totally accountable.  
 
EXECUTIVE SESSION 
 
Motion: It was moved by Councilman Dawson, seconded by Councilwoman Howard to go into 
executive session to discuss negotiations incident to a proposed contractual arrangement (Olsen 
tract lease agreement) and A-Tax Funds. The vote: YAYS – Councilman Rodman, Councilman 
Sommerville, Councilman Hervochon, Councilman Glover, Councilman McElynn, Councilman 
Covert, Councilman Dawson, and Councilman Lawson.  NAYS- Councilman Flewelling. The 
motion passed. 
 
MATTERS ARISING OUT OF EXECUTIVE SESSION  
 
Motion: It was moved by Councilman Flewelling, seconded by Councilwoman Howard to Direct staff 
to draft an Ordinance to ratify the existing lease signed in 2016 that expires in December 2019 and the 
easements that were negotiated at that time. The vote: YAYS – Councilman Rodman, Councilman 
Sommerville, Councilman Hervochon, Councilman Glover, Councilman McElynn, Councilman 
Covert, Councilman Dawson and Councilman Lawson. The motion passed 
 
Recommendation: Forward to County Council for approval 
 
Motion: It was moved by Councilman Flewelling, seconded by Councilman Glover to rescind the 
addendum signed in June 2018 and direct staff to negotiate two separate leases, one for the dwelling 
and one for the land and pond. The vote: YAYS- Councilman Rodman, Councilman Sommerville, 
Councilman Hervochon, Councilwoman Howard, Councilman Glover, Councilman McElynn, 
Councilman Covert, and Councilman Lawson. The motion passed.  
 
Recommendation: Forward to County Council for approval 
 
 
DISCUSSION 
 
A. Supplement Appropriation and Reimbursement Resolution for Jenkins Island Safety 

Improvements-  Thomas J. Keaveny II, Beaufort County Attorney 
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Discussion:  Thomas Keaveny, Beaufort County Attorney, stated pursuant to the discussion council 
has been having regarding a funding shortfall with Jenkins Island safety improvement program. The 
way to approach this is to provide a supplemental appropriation for the difference between the proposed 
contract Council wants to enter into and the funding available $7.2 Million. They will need to prepare 
a supplemental ordinance with separate appropriation covering that for committee’s consideration 
because money is being appropriated, it has to go through a reimbursement resolution, which has been 
provided to committee.  The resolution doesn’t need to be passed until the third and final reading when 
the committee has an exact amount of money due by way of supplemental appropriation.  
 
Councilman Sommerville: Regarding reimbursement. Reimbursing who for what?  
 
Thomas Keaveny: The general fund will be reimbursed by through the bond. In order for that to 
happen we need to do a reimbursement resolution per the IRS. 
 
Councilman Sommerville stated he is against this because everything is contingent on if we are 
building the $9.5 Million project or not.  
 
Councilman Flewelling stated the best information the committee has right now, barring everything 
else, is that this is a safety project needed for the residents of Windmill Harbor and the people who 
travel along that section of highway 278. This is the best solution that we have that has been approved 
by the staff and recommended by staff and the experts in the field.   
 
Councilman Rodman stated he is also against this. Typically, would agree that he would want to protect 
all our options however an engineering effort has been put in place to see what we could do short term 
for both safety and congestion. High probability they will figure out a way to do this without spending 
the extra money.  
 
Councilman Hervochon stated the reason we need 6 lanes is because we have a traffic study that says 
we need 6 lanes. If we do 4 lanes, we will have to do another traffic study which is going to be another 
4-6 months and brings everyone back here talking about however many millions it will take to build 
this project based on the inflationary aspect of this construction.  He is going to support the project.  
 
Councilman McElynn stated there isn’t any harm to move forward with this and trying to allocate the 
$2 Million. If the study shows, it’s not needed it doesn’t have to be used. If the study shows it can be 
done for $7 Million that would be great, but this needs to be done.  
 
Motion: It was moved by Councilman Flewelling, seconded by Councilman Hervochon, to move 
along with first reading for borrowing roughly a $2.5 Million through an ordinance and resolution 
regarding the intent of the County. YAYS- Councilman Hervochon, Councilman Glover, Councilman 
McElynn, Councilman Covert, Councilman Lawson. NAYS- Councilman Rodman, Councilman 
Sommerville, Councilwoman Howard and Councilman Dawson. The motion passed.     
 
Recommendation: Forward to County Council for approval 
 
B.   2% A-Tax Funding Request.  
  1.  Penn Center Funding request for $822,000 for phase I building upgrades 
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Discussion:  Stefanie Nigid, Passive Parks Manager, stated this was brought forth to finance in August 
2019 with no motion. I was brought back up in October 2019 by Councilman Glover as an added item 
to the agenda during a finance committee meeting and the motion was to move the request to today’s 
executive committee meeting.  Funding request for phase I building upgrades that the Penn Center is 
requesting if for A-tax funding in the amount of $822,000.00. The packed that everyone has is the 
original that was provided in August 2019. We were just recently informed that A-tax funding requests 
have to be approved by ordinance instead of resolution. So the resolution you see in your packet can 
be marked out and in the backup is the actual ordinance language. 
 
Councilman Rodman stated that Council put in place a process for these request. Some may argue that 
this request has been pending before the process was put in place. It may influence whether people do 
or don’t vote against it.  
 
Councilman McElynn asked if Penn Center followed the requirements the finance chair developed 
even though it was getting moved ahead somewhat out of order? Request to have an application filed 
in accordance with the new system the finance chair has developed.  
 
Councilman Glover stated Penn Center made this request before this new process was put in place and 
asked Council grandfather them in as they have been waiting over a year.  
 
Councilwoman Howard: How much money do we have?  
 
County Administrator Jacobs: The chief financial officer says about $2.5 Million.  
 
Councilman Flewelling: How much do we get annually?  
 
County Administrator Jacobs: Not sure. 
 
Councilman Rodman: $600,000.00 - $800,000.00 but could be wrong.  
 
Councilman Flewelling- Can we get an answer to that?  
 
Marion Burns, Penn Center Interim Executive Director, stated that a presentation was brought forth in 
a meeting in March 2019 making two presentations in front of the finance committee. After that 
meeting everyone seemed excited about the proposal and wanting to move forward with it.  The longer 
the Penn Center waits for renovations the costlier it will be to rebuild.  The county is not the only place 
that the Penn Center is looking to for financing for the renovations. This process was actually in place 
with the previous County Administrator and the previous executive Director at the Penn Center before 
taking over in August 2018.  
 
Councilman McElynn: How many phases?  
 
Mr. Burns: There are 2 phases.  
 
Councilman McElynn: How much is phase II?  
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Mr. Burns: Phase II is $952,000.00. 
 
Councilman McElynn: When will the request be made for phase II?  
 
Mr. Burns:  The request will be made probably sometime next year.  
 
Councilman McElynn:  Phase II is going out for other funding sources as well?  
 
Mr. Burns: Yes 
 
Councilman Sommerville: How many entities are legally under the Penn Center umbrella and which 
one are we dealing with?  
 
Mr. Burns: LLC is the restaurant and hotel. 
 
Councilman Sommerville: Parent Organization is 501 (c) 3 and 1 LLC? 
 
Mr. Burns: Yes, Penn Center is 501(c)3.  
 
Councilman Sommerville: With 1 LLC underneath?   
 
Mr. Burns: Yes 
 
Councilman Sommerville: The 501 (c)3 is making the request. The Penn Center is always needing 
money. What assurance do we have that this amount of money is going to solve a problem and you 
won’t be back in six months to a year needing more money?  
 
Mr. Burns: These are historical buildings that have been around for many years. Last time these 
buildings were renovated it was in the mid 1990’s when the late Senator Hollings was responsible for 
the renovations. Some of these buildings are in dire need of renovations.  
 
Councilman Sommerville: So the last renovations were federally funded?  
 
Mr. Burns. Yes, to his knowledge the county has never been involved with any major renovations for 
the Penn Center.  
 
Councilman Covert: The Penn Center is a 501 (c)3, what is the name of the Penn Center’s LLC?  
 
Mr. Burns: Doesn’t know at the moment. There is research being done on that because of some tax 
issues that came up.  LLC was formed for the purpose of renting the restaurant and hotel.  
 
Councilman Covert: Penn Center looking at other avenues for funding and how much is the total?  
 
Mr. Burns: Through National Parks Service Penn Center is looking at a $500,000.00 grant to renovate 
Gantt Cottage and Frissell. If the grant is approved Frissell cottage wouldn’t needed to be included in 
the amount requested from the county, removing $195,000.00 from the $822,000.00 requested.  
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Councilman Lawson: In the past couple of years has Beaufort County given any money to the Penn 
Center through A-tax or any other funding?  
 
Mr. Burns: No, for A-tax and not sure about anything before.  
 
Councilman Hervochon: Are there any incentives to raise funds outside of Beaufort county and how 
successful or unsuccessful has that been?  
 
Mr. Burns: National Parks Service granted $50,000.00 to Art History for 1961-1970. Grant was put in 
for the renovation for Gantt Cottage but no money has been received and they were asked submit 
another application for the grant.  
 
Councilman Flewelling:  Huge supporter of the Penn Center and School. It is a significant source of 
tourism revenue for Beaufort Count. Looking at the list of repairs, there are urgent repairs that need to 
be done today or the buildings will collapse.  To move forward and get the ball rolling and to show 
support and commitment to the Penn Center from Beaufort County, suggests that $411,000.00 be given 
from 3% Accommodation tax. 
 
Councilman Glover: Motion for full $822,000.00.  
 
Councilman Flewelling: Concerned with the fact that there isn’t full accounting of the 3% A-tax fund. 
How much specifically to the dollar, is in the fund? How much is in the fund right now? How much 
has been committed to be spent out of it this year? What is the annual source of revenue? How much 
revenue it generates roughly year to year for the 5 years?  What is known is that there is a $500,000.00 
available to send to this project right now to get it going and move forward.  
 
Councilwoman Howard: There is a new procedure for A-tax which includes different steps once the 
money is received. If the money goes forward procedures must be followed by every group on how 
money is expended.  
 
Mr. Burns: Transparency is an absolute.  
 
Councilwoman Howard: Will you follow the same procedures as you use for federal grants? The 
county has guidance for procurement of rehab of these buildings and would like that to be followed. 
That way council can point directly to the money given and say that is where the money went to the 
best and lowest bidder.  
 
Councilman Dawson: Mr. Burns gave an excellent presentation to show rehab work that is needed to 
the historical buildings on Penn Site. When St. Helena came along, we did everything we could to get 
that up and running and sustainable and suggest that we do the same for the Penn Center. 
 
Councilman McElynn: If money is granted and you get additional money will that extra go to Phase 
II? 
 
Mr. Burns: Yes, that is preferable.  
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Councilman Lawson: Support Penn Center 100%. Money needs to be given immediately. Agreed with 
the idea of giving Penn Center ½ or a portion of it immediately and then having Penn Center go through 
the process to get the rest of the requested money. Make sure it is fair to everyone out there but for the 
Penn Center to be a priority. Supports Councilman Flewelling’s recommendation. 
 
Motion: It was moved by Councilman Glover, seconded by Councilman McElynn to go into first 
reading with the amount of $600,000.00 with the understanding that we are going to be focusing, as 
we go forward, on the role the County can play to help the process and how it may go through the 
County’s procurement procedure. They vote: YAYS- Councilman Rodman, Councilman Sommerville, 
Councilwoman Howard, Councilman Flewelling, Councilman Covert, Councilman Dawson, and 
Councilman Lawson.  NAYS- Councilman Hervochon.  
 
Recommendation: Forward to County Council for approval 
 
Councilman Flewelling: Really would like to have the data on the 3% A-tax funding. May be 
amendable to an amendment at first or second reading to up the funding to $822,000.00 if appropriate 
data is given.  
 
Ashley Jacobs, County Administrator: Sent link BeaufortCounty.gov/finance there are reports and 2% 
over 3%. 3% has $2.461 Million.  
  

  
2. Hilton Head Island Concours D’elegance & Motoring Festival request for         

                $10,000.00 
 
Discussion:  Councilman Rodman stated the car portion in the past has gone through the A-tax fund. 
Years later it received $10,000.00 to go through the Airport portion of it. When it came forward there 
was some discussion about taking that through the 3% and it seems to me having that small dollar 
amount and running it through the 3% would take us far beyond where they would need the money. 
They are roughly short $10,000.00 in the budget, in the airport portion of it. When the runway was 
lengthened it increased the ability to bring more airplanes in. It’s becoming much more of an aerospace 
type of thing. United Airlines is a sponsor and some of the senior executives will be coming this time. 
A Brazilian Company called Embraer Air is the primary manufacturer of commercial regional jets is 
coming to see if they want to be a sponsor. They are in a little bit of a hole needing the $10,000.00 and 
the event being 2 weeks from this weekend. Question we have is, do we want to refer it to the 2% 
committee to look at or just figure out a way to come up with $10,000.00 whether it is from 2%, the 
county administrator or from the airport fund? 
 
Councilman McElynn: How much did we already give them?  
 
Councilman Rodman: On the car side they have been given the money, what they have been doing is 
asking for $40,000.00 and got $26,000.00. We have been giving $10,000.00 the past year or so to the 
airplane side. 
 
Councilman Dawson: Is this a private company or a 501(c)3? 
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Councilman Rodman: 501(c)3. This is the best way to showcase the airport and bring in a lot of 
revenue.  
 
County Administrator Ashley Jacobs stated they have consistently been getting 2% funds.  If they ask 
for additional 2% funding now they would need to amend their application and then it would be a 
question of whether or not, you would allow that.  Past 4-5 years they have requested and received 
funds from the administrator’s contingency fund and we cut that fund back this. 
 
Councilman Rodman asked if there was a motion to do anything with this?  
 
Motion. No motion. 
 
Adjournment:  5:28 p.m. 
 
 
 
Ratified by Committee:  
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BEAUFORT COUNTY COUNCIL 

Agenda Item Summary 

Item Title: 

Council Committee: 

Meeting Date: 

 
Committee Presenter (Name and Title): 

 
Issues for Consideration: 

 
Points to Consider: 

 
Funding & Liability Factors: 

 
Council Options: 

 
Recommendation: 

Hilton Head Island Airport Campus Entrance Improvements

Executive

October 28, 2019

Jon Rembold, Airports Director, C.M.

Contract Award Recommendation for IFB #082719 Hilton Head Island Airport Entry Enhancements
REBID

Recommendation for contract award to JS Construction, Okatie, SC in amount of $281,783.00 for
the Hilton Head Airport Entrance Improvements Project.

Town of Hilton Head Island 2018 Accommodations Tax dollars ($100,000), County Bond Proceeds
designated by County Council ($200,000), and Airport Operating Revenues.

Approve, Modify or Reject

Approve



AOS Specialty Contractors Inc. JS Construction Quality Enterprises Patterson Inc

Unit/Base Pricing Price

Number of Days to Complete the work from the date of the NTP 56 25

IFB 082719  HHI Airport Entry Enhancements

     331,000.00 
Turn Key Base price for the renovation and enhancement of the existing Hilton Head 

Island Airport Entrance. See the attached plans on the website.  Price must include all 
permits, License fees, materials, labor, and taxes.

1 no bid           281,783.00   no bid 
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TO:  Councilman Paul Sommerville, Chairman, Beaufort County Governmental   
Committee 

 
FROM:  Howard Ackerman, Chairman, Beaufort County Airports Board 
 
SUBJ: Contract Award Recommendation for IFB #082719 Hilton Head Island Airport Entry 

Enhancements REBID 
 
DATE:  October 17, 2019 
 
 
BACKGROUND.   
 
On October 17, 2019, the Beaufort County Airports Board reviewed the following item: 
 
 Contract Award Recommendation: Hilton Head Island Airport Campus Entrance 

Improvement   
 
The board recommends award of the contract for the Hilton Head Island Airport Entrance 
Improvements Project to JS Construction of Okatie, SC.   
 
 
 
cc: Ashley Jacobs, County Administrator 
      Jon Rembold, Airports Director 
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TO:  Mr. Howard Ackerman, Chairman, Beaufort County Airports Board 
 
FROM:  Jon Rembold, C.M., Airports Director  
 
SUBJ:      Contract Award Recommendation for IFB #082719 Hilton Head Island Airport Entry    
     Enhancements REBID    
                
DATE:  October 17, 2019 
 
 
BACKGROUND:   
 
The subject project was recently rebid due to unacceptable bids in the initial response to the 
Invitation for Bid.  After evaluation of the rebid information, JS Construction of Okatie, SC is 
recommended as the project contractor. 
 
 
VENDOR  INFORMATION:                                        COST: 
Bid: 
AOS Specialty Contractors Inc., Lexington, SC                                                   $499,530.00   
JS Construction, Okatie, SC                                                                                 $390,145.00 
Quality Enterprise, Naples, FL                                                                              $677,770.00 
Patterson Inc. of Beaufort, SC                                                                              $330,838.11   
 
Rebid:  
AOS Specialty Contractors Inc., Lexington, SC                                                     no bid 
JS Construction, Okatie, SC                                                                                  $281,783.00 
Quality Enterprises, Naples, FL                                                                             no bid 
Patterson Inc. of Beaufort, SC                                                                               $331,000.00 
 
 
FOR ACTION:  Beaufort County Airports Board 
 
 
RECOMMENDATION:  Approval of Recommendation of contract award to JS Construction, 
Okatie, SC in the amount of $281,783.00 for the Hilton Head Island Airport Entrance 
Improvements Project. 
 

 
  
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
TO:  Councilman Paul Sommerville, Chairman, Beaufort County Governmental Committee    
 
FROM:  Dave Thomas, CPPO, Purchasing Director 
 
SUBJ: Contract Award Recommendation for IFB #082719 Hilton Head Island Airport Entry 

Enhancements REBID 
 
DATE:  October 17, 2019 
 
BACKGROUND:  Hilton Head Island Airport is undertaking a project to improve the campus entrance.  
This project will improve the main entrance on the commercial service side of the Hilton Head Island 
Airport.  Among other items, the project includes a new sign, installation of new landscaping, and 
installation of the sculpture, “Humanus” at the entrance.  It is important that this project start soon in 
order to take advantage of the prime planting season for native landscaping. 
The total project cost (engineering costs and construction costs) is funded by a combination of Town of 
Hilton Head Island 2018 Accommodations Tax dollars ($100,000) and County Bond Proceeds 
designated by County Council ($200,000), and Airport Operating Revenues.  
 
VENDOR  INFORMATION:         COST: 
Bid: 
AOS Specialty Contractors Inc., Lexington, SC                                                                 $499,530.00   
JS Construction, Okatie, SC                                                                                               $390,145.00 
Quality Enterprise, Naples, FL                                                                                            $677,770.00 
Patterson Inc. of Beaufort, SC                                                                                            $330,838.11   
 
Rebid:  
AOS Specialty Contractors Inc., Lexington, SC                                                                  no bid 
JS Construction, Okatie, SC                                                                                                $281,783.00 
Quality Enterprises, Naples, FL                                                                                           no bid 
Patterson Inc. of Beaufort, SC                                                                                             $331,000.00 
   
FUNDING: Town of Hilton Head Island 2018 Accommodations Tax dollars ($100,000), County Bond 
Proceeds designated by County Council ($200,000), and Airport Operating Revenues . 
 
FOR ACTION:  Governmental Committee October 28, 2019  
 
RECOMMENDATION:  Purchasing recommends that the Governmental Committee approve and 
recommend to County Council the contract award to JS Construction, Okatie, SC in the amount of 
$281,783.00 for the Hilton Head Island Airport Entrance Improvements Project.  
 
cc:     Ashley Jacobs, County Administrator 
            Chris Inglese, Deputy County Attorney 

Alicia Holland, Asst. County Administrator, Finance 
Jon Rembold, C.M., Airports Director 

 
Att: Bid Tabulation                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                             

COUNTY COUNCIL OF BEAUFORT COUNTY 
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 

106 Industrial Village Road 
Post Office Drawer 1228 

Beaufort, South Carolina 29901-1228 
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Points to Consider: 
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Council Options: 

 
Recommendation: 

Dropped Mill Rate Presentation

Executive Committee

October 28, 2019

Jim Beckert, County Auditor

The added attachments are taxes levied for 112 Port Royal from 2004 to 2019. These clearly show
2009 being the first year the 100th of a mill was levied. For years 2008 and back just the 10th of a
mill was levied. The levy for 2019 shows that 10th of a mill being levied per the direction of DOR.

None.







































From: Sanford Houck Jr.
To: Ward, Brittany
Subject: RE: Beaufort County, Millage Rates, 12-39-170
Date: Tuesday, September 24, 2019 10:57:03 AM
Attachments: image001.png

SCDOR_Logo_codetwo_690484a5-d006-453f-a4a7-07c3c37e0e0911.png

[EXTERNAL EMAIL] Please report any suspicious attachments, links, or requests for
sensitive information to the Beaufort County IT Division at helpdesk@bcgov.net or to
843-255-7000.

Brittany,
We are of the opinion that any fraction less than one tenth should be dropped as we discussed in our
examples we handed out for the Beaufort presentation on page 14. Our interpretation is any decimal
less than a tenth is dropped and not rounded. (57.15 or 57.19 becomes 57.1)

Sanford Houck Jr.
Administrator of Government Affairs
Government Services
803-898-5478 | Sanford.HouckJr@dor.sc.gov
South Carolina Department of Revenue | dor.sc.gov

The content of this email and any attachments may be confidential and legally protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient of this email,
please reply immediately to notify the sender, then delete it from your system. You are prohibited from sharing any part of this message with a third party.  
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